
Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column5 Column6 Column7 Column8 Column9 Column10 Column11 Column12 Column13 Column14 Column15

(All Prices Each)

Laramie Peak 

Motors Model Greiner Ford Model

KIG Vehicle 

Concepts

Fremont 

Chevrolet 

(Riverton) Model KGA

Legacy 

Brothers

Fremont 

Motors 

(Casper)

15/12 Passenger 

Van $58,300.00

12 Pass 

Transit $55,240.00

12 Pass 

Transit 102825.18 15 Pass Transit $48,955.00

12 Pass  

Express $54,965.00

12 Passenger 

Transit $72,307.00 Transit No Bid

Cargo Van $54,200.00 Transit $52,869.00 Transit 102825.18 Transit $46,004.00

 Express 

Cargo $51,010.00 Transit $63,006.50 Transit No Bid

Cargo Van Small No Bid $48,648.00 Transit 102825.18 Transit No Bid $44,506.00 Transit $43,096.50

Transit 

Connect No Bid

1 Ton Ranch $65,200.00

F350 

Superduty $61,410.00

F350 

Superduty $112,699.13 F350 Superduty $61,673.00

3500HD 

Silverado $62,912.00

F350 

Superduty $72,873.50

F250 

Superduty $62,557.00 3500 Ram

1 Ton Plant $49,300.00

F350 

Superduty $46,761.00

F350 

Superduty $112,699.13 F350 Superduty $49,777.00

3500HD 

Silverado $48,015.00

F350 

Superduty $58,722.00

F250 

Superduty $47,580.00 3500 Ram

1/2 Ton Plant $41,295.00 F-150 XL $41,366.00 F-150 F-250 XL $42,040.00

1500 

Silverado $41,283.00 F150 $50,263.00 F150 $44,886.00 Ram 1500

Mid Sized SUV $40,750.00 Explorer $44,669.00 Explorer Explorer $32,794.00

Chevy 

Equinox $43,945.00 Explorer $46,253.50 Explorer $49,696.00

Jeep Grand 

Cherokee


